
PUNJAB STATE ELECTRICITY REGULATORY COMMISSION 
SITE NO. 3, SECTOR 18-A, MADHYA MARG, CHANDIGARH-160018 

 

Public Notice in respect of Petition No. 90 of 2016 (ARR and Determination of 
Tariff for FY 2017-18 filed by Punjab State Power Corporation Limited) on 

remand by Hon’ble APTEL’s Order dated 08.03.2019 in  
Appeal No. 74 of 2018 & 113 of 2018 

 

1. In compliance of the Hon’ble APTEL’s Order dated 08.03.2019, the 
Commission issued notices to the concerned parties i.e. M/s Mawana Sugars 
Limited and M/s Northern India Textiles Mills Association, to file their 
respective submissions/applications with the copy to PSPCL and PSPCL was 
directed to file reply to the submissions/applications filed by the parties.  

2. Tariff Order for FY 2017-18 issued vide the Commission’s Order dated 
23.10.2017 & 09.11.2017, Hon’ble APTEL’s Order, applications filed by the 
parties and the reply of PSPCL on the same are available on the website 
“www.pserc.gov.in” of PSERC and can be downloaded there from. 

3. Comments/Objections, if any, together with supporting material, may be filed 
with the Secretary, Punjab State Electricity Regulatory Commission, Site No. 
3, Sector 18-A, Madhya Marg, Chandigarh in person or through Registered 
Post, so as to reach him within 15 days of the publication of this notice.  

4. The Comments/Objections as above should carry signature, full name, postal 
address, telephone/mobile number and email of the sender. All the objectors 
may also send a soft copy of their Comments/Objections to the 
Secretary/PSERC at email id “secretarypsercchd@gmail.com”. If the objection 
is filed on behalf of any organization or any class of consumers, it should be so 
mentioned. It may also be specifically mentioned if the person putting in 
objections/comments also wants to be heard in person. 

5. The Punjab State Electricity Regulatory Commission shall hold a public 
hearing in the matter on 15.10.2019 at 11.00 AM in the Commission’s office. 
All the objectors who have filed their objections with the Commission by the 
last date for filing of the Comments/Objections and other 
persons/organizations interested in presenting their view/suggestions on the 
above mentioned matters before the Commission are invited to participate. 

 
Sd/- 

Secretary 
 
 

Click here for Aptel Order 

Click here for written submission of Northern Textiles 

Click here for written submission of Mawana Sugars 

Click here for reply of PSPCL against submission made by Northern Textiles 

Click here for reply of PSPCL against submission made by Mawana 

Click here for PSPCL Tariff Order 2017-18 dated 23.10.2017 

Click here for order dated 09th Nov. 2017 
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